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High-powered Boston attorney Emma Madison is celebrating her latest courtroom victory when she gets a
call from a number she doesn't recognize. Area code 803—home.

Home is Juneberry, South Carolina—eight hundred miles, twelve years, and a lifetime away from
Boston—and Emma's father has had a serious heart attack. Emma rushes to his bedside, and a weekend trip
threatens to become an extended stay. She has to work fast to arrange the affairs of his small-town law
practice so she can return to her life and career in Boston.

And then Michael Evans shows up. They'd shared hopes, dreams, and a passionate love as young college
students during a long-ago summer. But Emma walked away—from Michael and from Juneberry—to finish
college and start a new life. Michael has never forgotten her.

Enveloped in the warmth of family and small-town life—and discovering that she still cares for
Michael—Emma knows she'll have to make a choice between the career she's worked so hard to build and
the love she left behind.
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From reader reviews:

Daniel Reynolds:

Within other case, little persons like to read book A Beautiful Fall: A Novel. You can choose the best book if
you'd prefer reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a book A Beautiful Fall: A Novel.
You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right,
because from book you can recognize everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you can
be known. About simple point until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we can easily
open a book or searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel bored stiff
to go to the library. Let's go through.

Douglas Whatley:

Typically the book A Beautiful Fall: A Novel will bring someone to the new experience of reading a book.
The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book to learn, this book
very acceptable to you. The book A Beautiful Fall: A Novel is much recommended to you to read. You can
also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Meredith Daugherty:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their free time with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, planning to
beach, or picnic in the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? May be reading a book is usually option to fill your totally
free time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you
want to try look for book, may be the e-book untitled A Beautiful Fall: A Novel can be good book to read.
May be it can be best activity to you.

Jose Lloyd:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many concern for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading.
Some people likes studying, not only science book but also novel and A Beautiful Fall: A Novel or even
others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel want to read
more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those textbooks are
helping them to put their knowledge. In other case, beside science book, any other book likes A Beautiful
Fall: A Novel to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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