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In the best-selling book The Power of Now, Eckhart Tolle spells out in remarkably clear terms how living in
the Now is the truest path to happiness and enlightenment. The Power of Now weekly engagement calendar
pairs quotes of wisdom by Tolle with spectacular images from world-class photographers.

12 full-color monthly tabs featuring stunning nature photography paired with wisdom quotes by Eckhart●

Tolle.
The perfect inspirational art gift.●

Includes a bonus Notes section for journaling extra information throughout the year.●

Hardcover datebook with Wire-O binding and elastic band closure.●

52 weekly pages with month- and year-at-a-glance calendars.●

Includes a handy pocket to store extra papers.●

Published by Amber Lotus, an independent carbon-negative US company that has planted more than half a●

million trees since 2008.
This calendar features US and Canadian legal holidays, phases of the moon, and important observances of●

the world's major religions.

The images in The Power of Now engagement calendar have been carefully selected to support the teachings
of The Power of Now, helping readers connect to this essential wisdom and stay focused in the present
moment all year long. Tolle is also the author of the bestseller A New Earth. He has appeared and taught on
the Oprah Winfrey Show. His monthly teachings on Eckhart Tolle TV can be found online.
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From reader reviews:

Todd Jacobs:

The book The Power of Now 2016 Engagement Datebook Calendar can give more knowledge and also the
precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave a very important thing like a
book The Power of Now 2016 Engagement Datebook Calendar? Several of you have a different opinion
about reserve. But one aim that will book can give many info for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to
closer using your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you may give for each other; you are
able to share all of these. Book The Power of Now 2016 Engagement Datebook Calendar has simple shape
however, you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by
available and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Thomas Baldwin:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also be a life style. This reading routine give you lot of
advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the book in
which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of reserve you
read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want really feel
happy read one with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual The Power of Now 2016
Engagement Datebook Calendar is kind of publication which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Francis Knapp:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try and and must have the spare time or they will get wide
range of stress from both daily life and work. So , if we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not just a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you possess
when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever try this
one, reading guides. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, often the book you have read is
usually The Power of Now 2016 Engagement Datebook Calendar.

Russell Thomas:

This The Power of Now 2016 Engagement Datebook Calendar is brand new way for you who has curiosity
to look for some information since it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge
more you know or perhaps you who still having bit of digest in reading this The Power of Now 2016
Engagement Datebook Calendar can be the light food for you personally because the information inside this
specific book is easy to get by anyone. These books produce itself in the form which is reachable by anyone,
yes I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in guide form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this
reserve is the answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find actually
looking for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book type for your
better life as well as knowledge.
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