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In 1835, Lord Macaulay, in his Minute on Indian Education, had prophesied that the eventual self-rule
of India would be "the proudest day in British history."

And yet when independence came on the stroke of midnight of August 14, 1947, events unfolded with a
violence that shocked the world: entire trainloads of Muslim and Hindu refugees were slaughtered on their
flight to safety -- not by the British, but by each other. Macaulay's dream had become a flawed and bloody
reality. The Proudest Day is a riveting account of the end of the Raj, the most romantic of all the great
empires. Anthony Read and David Fisher tell the whole epic story in compelling and colorful detail from its
beginnings more than a century earlier; their powerful narrative takes a fresh look at many of the events and
personalities involved, especially the three charismatic giants --Gandhi, Nehru, and Jinnah --who dominated
the final, increasingly bitter thirty years. Meanwhile, a succession of British politicians and viceroys veered
wildly between liberalism and repression until the Raj became a powder keg, wanting only a match.
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From reader reviews:

Alvin Pryor:

This The Proudest Day: India's Long Road to Independence book is simply not ordinary book, you have after
that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is information inside this book
incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you
will get. This The Proudest Day: India's Long Road to Independence without we recognize teach the one
who looking at it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't be worry The Proudest Day: India's Long
Road to Independence can bring once you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' turn into full
because you can have it in your lovely laptop even cell phone. This The Proudest Day: India's Long Road to
Independence having very good arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not really feel
uninterested in reading.

Christopher Larsen:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the concept The Proudest
Day: India's Long Road to Independence suitable to you? Typically the book was written by popular writer
in this era. The book untitled The Proudest Day: India's Long Road to Independenceis a single of several
books this everyone read now. This specific book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you
read this reserve you will enter the new age that you ever know prior to. The author explained their concept
in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to be aware of the core of this guide. This book will give you
a wide range of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world in this
particular book.

Donald Pate:

You could spend your free time to see this book this publication. This The Proudest Day: India's Long Road
to Independence is simple to deliver you can read it in the park, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did
not get much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you easier to
read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get
when one buys this book.

Elbert Gibson:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many problem for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some
people likes reading through, not only science book but in addition novel and The Proudest Day: India's
Long Road to Independence or others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the
fantastic a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher as well as
students especially. Those guides are helping them to add their knowledge. In additional case, beside science
guide, any other book likes The Proudest Day: India's Long Road to Independence to make your spare time a



lot more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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