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"[Sure to become] a classic in the field. Highly recommended." ?Library Journal

"... full of surprises and intrigues and written in a beautiful style.... a breath of fresh air on the African-
Islamic-American connection." ?Journal of the American Academy of Religion

The involvement of black Americans with Islam reaches back to the earliest days of the African presence in
North America. Part I of the book explores these roots in the Middle East, West Africa, and antebellum
America. Part II tells the story of the "Prophets of the City"?the leaders of the new urban-based African
American Muslim movements in the 20th century. Turner places the study of Islam in the context of the
racial, ethical, and political relations that influenced the reception of successive presentations of Islam,
including the West African Islam of slaves, the Ahmadiyya Movement from India, the orthodox Sunni
practice of later immigrants, and the Nation of Islam. This second edition features a new introduction, which
discusses developments since the earlier edition, including Islam in a post-9/11 America.
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From reader reviews:

Edwin Courville:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the name Islam in
the African-American Experience, Second Edition suitable to you? Often the book was written by well
known writer in this era. Often the book untitled Islam in the African-American Experience, Second
Editionis the main one of several books in which everyone read now. This specific book was inspired many
people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know
just before. The author explained their idea in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to
understand the core of this book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. To help
you to see the represented of the world in this book.

Leona Hicks:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them friends
and family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching
TV, as well as playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that is look
different you can read the book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you just read
you can spent all day every day to reading a guide. The book Islam in the African-American Experience,
Second Edition it is very good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. These folks
were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy often
the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not very
costly but this book provides high quality.

Curtis Waters:

The book untitled Islam in the African-American Experience, Second Edition contain a lot of information on
it. The writer explains the woman idea with easy method. The language is very simple to implement all the
people, so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was published by famous
author. The author will bring you in the new age of literary works. You can actually read this book because
you can please read on your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. In a
situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can available their official web-site and order it. Have a nice
learn.

Armida Shipman:

Publication is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen will need book to know the change information of year to year. As we know
those publications have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around
the world. By book Islam in the African-American Experience, Second Edition we can acquire more
advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? Being creative person must prefer to read a book. Only



choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at this time book Islam in
the African-American Experience, Second Edition. You can more appealing than now.
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