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Poet, philosopher, and sensitive misanthrope, a spectacular fly in the ointment of the refined eleventh-
century Andalusian-Jewish elite, Solomon Ibn Gabirol comes down to us as one of the most complicated
intellectual figures in the history of post-biblical Judaism. Unlike his worldly predecessor Shmuel HaNagid,
the first important poet of the period, Ibn Gabirol was a reclusive, mystically inclined figure whose modern-
sounding medieval poems range from sublime descriptions of the heavenly spheres to poisonous jabs at court
life and its pretenders. His verse, which demonstrates complete mastery of the classicizing avant-garde
poetics of the day, grafted an Arabic aesthetic onto a biblical vocabulary and Jewish setting, taking Hebrew
poetry to a level of metaphysical sophistication and devotional power it has not achieved since.

Peter Cole's selection includes poems from nearly all of Ibn Gabirol's secular and liturgical lyric genres, as
well as a complete translation of the poet's long masterwork, "Kingdom's Crown." Cole's rich, inventive
introduction places the poetry in historical context and charts its influence through the centuries. Extensive
annotations accompany the poems. This companion volume to Peter Cole's critically acclaimed Selected
Poems of Shmuel HaNagid presents the first comprehensive selection of Ibn Gabirol's verse to be published
in English and brings to life an astonishing body of poetry by one of the greatest Jewish writers of all time.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Shell:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book particularly book entitled
Selected Poems of Solomon Ibn Gabirol the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most
aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging each and every word
written in a book then become one type conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get before.
The Selected Poems of Solomon Ibn Gabirol giving you a different experience more than blown away your
brain but also giving you useful data for your better life with this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing
pattern this is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a
sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Shawn Francis:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't evaluate book by its handle may doesn't work
at this point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
appearance likes. Maybe you answer may be Selected Poems of Solomon Ibn Gabirol why because the
amazing cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or
content is actually fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly guide you
to pick up this book.

Dennis Winters:

It is possible to spend your free time to see this book this e-book. This Selected Poems of Solomon Ibn
Gabirol is simple to bring you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train along with soon. If you
did not have much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you
simpler to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits
that you will get when you buy this book.

Doris Garcia:

This Selected Poems of Solomon Ibn Gabirol is new way for you who has curiosity to look for some
information mainly because it relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more
you know or else you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this Selected Poems of Solomon Ibn
Gabirol can be the light food to suit your needs because the information inside this particular book is easy to
get by means of anyone. These books build itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone, sure I mean in
the e-book contact form. People who think that in publication form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this e-
book is the answer. So there is no in reading a publication especially this one. You can find actually looking
for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book kind for your better life and also
knowledge.
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