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Antoine Rey thought he had the perfect surprise for his sister Mélanie's birthday: a weekend by the sea at
Noirmoutier Island , where the pair spent many happy childhood summers playing on the beach. It had been
too long, Antoine thought, since they'd returned to the island?over thirty years, since their mother died and
the family holidays ceased. But the island's haunting beauty triggers more than happy memories; it reminds
Mélanie of something unexpected and deeply disturbing about their last island summer. When, on the drive
home to Paris, she finally summons the courage to reveal what she knows to Antoine, her emotions
overcome her and she loses control of the car.

Trapped in the wake of a family secret shrouded by taboo, Antoine must confront his past and also his
troubled relationships with his own children. How well does he really know his mother, his children, even
himself? Suddenly fragile on all fronts – as a son, a husband, a brother and a father – Antoine Rey will soon
learn the shocking truth about his family and himself.

By turns thrilling and seductive, with a lingering effect that is bittersweet and redeeming, Tatiana de
Rosnay's A Secret Kept is the story of a modern family and the invisible ties that hold it together.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Summers:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive at this point, people have
do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by means of
surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated the item for a while is reading.
Sure, by reading a e-book your ability to survive improve then having chance to remain than other is high.
For you who want to start reading a new book, we give you this kind of A Secret Kept: A Novel book as
starter and daily reading book. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Kimberly Mason:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try point that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you already been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love A Secret Kept: A
Novel, it is possible to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of
hangout type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout people. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its identified
as reading friends.

Sandra Fritz:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this A Secret Kept: A Novel e-book written by
well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that could be understand by anyone who have
read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping every ideas and producing skill only for
eliminate your own personal hunger then you still hesitation A Secret Kept: A Novel as good book not only
by the cover but also by the content. This is one guide that can break don't judge book by its cover, so do you
still needing another sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already said so why you
have to listening to another sixth sense.

Jeffry Yanez:

This A Secret Kept: A Novel is fresh way for you who has interest to look for some information given it
relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still
having bit of digest in reading this A Secret Kept: A Novel can be the light food to suit your needs because
the information inside this kind of book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books develop itself in the
form which is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in
book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a
guide especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss the
item! Just read this e-book variety for your better life in addition to knowledge.
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