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Alien queen Kora has a problem as vast as the endless crimson deserts. She’s the first female ruler of her
territory in generations, but her people are rioting and call for her violent younger twin brother to take the
throne. Despite assassination attempts, a mounting uprising of nomadic human rebels, and pressure to find a
mate to help her rule, she’s determined to protect her people from her brother’s would-be tyrannical rule.

Eros is a rebel soldier hated by aliens and human alike for being a half-blood. Yet that doesn’t stop him from
defending his people, at least until Kora’s soldiers raze his camp and take him captive. He’s given an
ultimatum: be an enslaved bodyguard to Kora, or be executed for his true identity—a secret kept even from
him.

When Kora and Eros are framed for the attempted assassination of her betrothed, they flee. Their only
chance of survival is to turn themselves in to the high court, where revealing Eros’s secret could mean a
swift public execution. But when they uncover a violent plot to end the human insurgency, they must find a
way to work together to prevent genocide.

Sky Pony Press, with our Good Books, Racehorse and Arcade imprints, is proud to publish a broad range of
books for young readers—picture books for small children, chapter books, books for middle grade readers,
and novels for young adults. Our list includes bestsellers for children who love to play Minecraft; stories told
with LEGO bricks; books that teach lessons about tolerance, patience, and the environment, and much more.
While not every title we publish becomes a New York Times bestseller or a national bestseller, we are
committed to books on subjects that are sometimes overlooked and to authors whose work might not
otherwise find a home.
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From reader reviews:

Archie Beard:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As it is known to us that
book is very important normally. The book Beyond the Red had been making you to know about other
know-how and of course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The e-book
Beyond the Red is not only giving you considerably more new information but also being your friend when
you feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship
together with the book Beyond the Red. You never experience lose out for everything when you read some
books.

Ok Lord:

This Beyond the Red book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit
you receive by reading this book will be information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get details
which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This particular Beyond the Red
without we realize teach the one who reading it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't
always be worry Beyond the Red can bring whenever you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves'
turn into full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even cellphone. This Beyond the Red having
excellent arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Violet Jarrell:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the name Beyond the Red
suitable to you? Typically the book was written by popular writer in this era. The book untitled Beyond the
Redis the one of several books in which everyone read now. This specific book was inspired lots of people in
the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new age that you ever know before. The author
explained their thought in the simple way, consequently all of people can easily to know the core of this
reserve. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. To help you to see the
represented of the world in this particular book.

Nicolas Dandrea:

Why? Because this Beyond the Red is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve waiting for you to
snap this but latter it will distress you with the secret the item inside. Reading this book alongside it was
fantastic author who write the book in such remarkable way makes the content within easier to understand,
entertaining approach but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating
having this anymore or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of advantages than the
other book possess such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking approach. So , still want
to delay having that book? If I have been you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.
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