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Past Sins Cast a Long Shadow 

Dallas Phillips refuses to believe her father committed suicide, even though things were tough on his farm
and he was deeply in debt. When she hears he'd told a neighbor about an upcoming windfall, she grows
suspicious, and her suspicion only deepens when she realizes someone is lurking in the nearby mountains
after dark. 

For help, she turns to Trey Jakes, local police chief—and her former lover. As they begin to investigate,
another mystery comes to light. Trey's mother is beginning to remember events from thirty years ago,
something shadowy that happened in the mountains, and Dallas's father was there, too. Is what happened that
night connected to his "suicide"? As they search for the truth, Trey and Dallas struggle to fight their
attraction, but they may not be able to fend off another force—a killer who's more than willing to kill again
to make sure old secrets stay buried.
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From reader reviews:

Susan Williams:

The book Wild Hearts (Secrets and Lies Book 1) gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You
need to use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can being your best friend when you
getting pressure or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make studying a book Wild
Hearts (Secrets and Lies Book 1) to get your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your current
capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You may know everything if you like
wide open and read a e-book Wild Hearts (Secrets and Lies Book 1). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means
that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this book?

Albertha Lemons:

This book untitled Wild Hearts (Secrets and Lies Book 1) to be one of several books in which best seller in
this year, that's because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy
this kind of book in the book shop or you can order it by using online. The publisher of the book sells the e-
book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, because you can read this book in your Cell phone. So
there is no reason to you personally to past this book from your list.

Lillie Stein:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try and pick
one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its include may doesn't work at this
point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside search
likes. Maybe you answer might be Wild Hearts (Secrets and Lies Book 1) why because the wonderful cover
that make you consider about the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content is usually
fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this
book.

Frank Arnett:

This Wild Hearts (Secrets and Lies Book 1) is brand new way for you who has fascination to look for some
information because it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know
otherwise you who still having little bit of digest in reading this Wild Hearts (Secrets and Lies Book 1) can
be the light food in your case because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get by simply
anyone. These books create itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book
contact form. People who think that in reserve form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this guide is the
answer. So you cannot find any in reading a book especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It
should be here for a person. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book sort for your better life in addition to
knowledge.
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