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Veteran comedian and radio personality Artie Lange turns an unflinching eye and his signature wit on his
perilous descent into drug addiction, life-threatening depression, and ultimately, his recovery, in the follow-
up to his hilariously raw debut, #1 New York Times bestseller Too Fat to Fish.

At a high point in his career, Artie Lange played a sold-out show in Carnegie Hall and totally killed—yet
during his standing ovation, all he could think of were the two bags of heroin in his pocket. In the midst of a
deep, self-destructive depression, addicted to heroin and prescription drugs, he lashed out at everyone around
him— from his fellow cast members on The Howard Stern Show, to celebrity guests, his longtime friends,
and even his own family.

By turns dark and disturbing, hilarious and heartbreaking, and always drop-dead honest, Crash and Burn lifts
the curtain on Artie’s dangerous slide, and offers a new, crystal-clear window into the mind of the addict. For
the first time, Artie reveals all: the full truth behind his now legendary Stern Show meltdown, his suicide
attempt (which he relates in terrifying detail), surprising stints in rehab, and painful relapses. With the help
and support of friends and family, Artie claws his way back, turning his life and career around. And despite
his slipups, backslides, and permanent losses, Artie forges on.

With Crash and Burn, Artie Lange goes all-in, confessing a story that is as shocking as it is funny, ever
tempered by his characteristic humor, self-awareness, and inimitable way with words.
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From reader reviews:

Manuel Rodriguez:

In other case, little people like to read book Crash and Burn. You can choose the best book if you like
reading a book. Given that we know about how is important any book Crash and Burn. You can add
information and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, because from book you
can understand everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About
simple factor until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we could open a book or perhaps
searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel uninterested to go to the
library. Let's examine.

Frances Lockhart:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading you can get
a lot of information that can give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their own reader with their story
or maybe their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the books. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on earth always try to
improve their skill in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write with their book. One of
them is this Crash and Burn.

Rodney Bell:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read
any book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent 24 hours a day to
reading a book. The book Crash and Burn it is quite good to read. There are a lot of individuals who
recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough space
to create this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from your smart
phone. The price is not to cover but this book offers high quality.

Amy Quist:

Reading a book to be new life style in this season; every people loves to go through a book. When you study
a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, since book has
a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that you have read.
In order to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you want to entertain
yourself you can read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, and also soon. The Crash and Burn offer
you a new experience in examining a book.
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