
Heraldry for the Dead: Memory, Identity, and the
Engraved Stone Plaques of Neolithic Iberia

Katina T. Lillios

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0292718225
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0292718225
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0292718225


Heraldry for the Dead: Memory, Identity, and the Engraved
Stone Plaques of Neolithic Iberia

Katina T. Lillios

Heraldry for the Dead: Memory, Identity, and the Engraved Stone Plaques of Neolithic Iberia Katina
T. Lillios

In the late 1800s, archaeologists began discovering engraved stone plaques in Neolithic (3500-2500 BC)
graves in southern Portugal and Spain. About the size of one's palm, usually made of slate, and incised with
geometric or, more rarely, zoomorphic and anthropomorphic designs, these plaques have mystified
generations of researchers. What do their symbols signify? How were the plaques produced? Were they worn
during an individual's lifetime, or only made at the time of their death? Why, indeed, were the plaques made
at all?

Employing an eclectic range of theoretical and methodological lenses, Katina Lillios surveys all that is
currently known about the Iberian engraved stone plaques and advances her own carefully considered
hypotheses about their manufacture and meanings. After analyzing data on the plaques' workmanship and
distribution, she builds a convincing case that the majority of the Iberian plaques were genealogical records
of the dead that served as durable markers of regional and local group identities. Such records, she argues,
would have contributed toward legitimating and perpetuating an ideology of inherited social difference in the
Iberian Late Neolithic.
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From reader reviews:

Clyde Connell:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what you problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man or woman? If you
don't have spare time to complete others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you
have spare time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They have to answer that
question because just their can do which. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every person.
Yes, it is right. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this kind of Heraldry for the Dead:
Memory, Identity, and the Engraved Stone Plaques of Neolithic Iberia to read.

Modesto Delarosa:

This Heraldry for the Dead: Memory, Identity, and the Engraved Stone Plaques of Neolithic Iberia book is
not really ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this
book is information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper you read a
lot of information you will get. This kind of Heraldry for the Dead: Memory, Identity, and the Engraved
Stone Plaques of Neolithic Iberia without we know teach the one who reading through it become critical in
considering and analyzing. Don't always be worry Heraldry for the Dead: Memory, Identity, and the
Engraved Stone Plaques of Neolithic Iberia can bring if you are and not make your case space or
bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even telephone. This Heraldry for
the Dead: Memory, Identity, and the Engraved Stone Plaques of Neolithic Iberia having excellent
arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Patricia Howland:

The reserve with title Heraldry for the Dead: Memory, Identity, and the Engraved Stone Plaques of Neolithic
Iberia posesses a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This
book exist new know-how the information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world
now. That is important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This particular book will
bring you throughout new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so
you can read this anywhere you want.

Kimberly Dyer:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve
that need more time to be study. Heraldry for the Dead: Memory, Identity, and the Engraved Stone Plaques
of Neolithic Iberia can be your answer given it can be read by an individual who have those short free time
problems.
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