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A modern-day Detroit success story that fuels the entrepreneurial fire

"Irrational Persistence" tells the story of Garden Fresh Gourmet, and how two entrepreneurs turned a
million-dollar debt to a 100-million-dollar annual revenue. Woody Allen famously said that 80 percent of
success is just showing up; but any entrepreneur can tell you that it's the other 20 percent that's key. The
founders of Garden Fresh took that old saying to heart, building so many strategic advantages into their
products and business that their 'sales' team didn't have to do any selling--they simply had to show up. In this
book, you'll find out what kind of legwork goes into building a mega-success product, and the strategies,
methods, and just plain stubbornness that helped two guys from Detroit build a market leader.

Garden Fresh Gourmet is now the number-one fresh salsa in the US, shipping over a million units every
week to Costco, Walmart, Whole Foods, and other national chains--and it all began with two middle-aged
guys with negative funds and plenty of ideas. This book shares their journey, insight, and passion to help you
build a better business and take it to the top. Learn how two entrepreneurs went from major debt to major
revenue Discover the key characteristics of a product that sells itself Consider why selling out might not be
the ultimate goal Track a journey of 'irrational persistence' from rags to riches

Garden Fresh Gourmet is an inspiration beyond the journey--the way you run things at the top matters, too.
"Irrational Persistence" shows you how to make the tough decisions, live with the sacrifices, and prioritize
your values as you build your brand and just keep on going.
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From reader reviews:

Holly Silva:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. To be sure that
book is very important for us. The book Irrational Persistence: Seven Secrets That Turned a Bankrupt Startup
Into a $231,000,000 Business has been making you to know about other understanding and of course you can
take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The e-book Irrational Persistence: Seven Secrets
That Turned a Bankrupt Startup Into a $231,000,000 Business is not only giving you far more new
information but also for being your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your current spend
time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship with all the book Irrational Persistence: Seven Secrets
That Turned a Bankrupt Startup Into a $231,000,000 Business. You never sense lose out for everything in
the event you read some books.

Shirley Davenport:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
household or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you
can read a book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent 24
hours a day to reading a publication. The book Irrational Persistence: Seven Secrets That Turned a Bankrupt
Startup Into a $231,000,000 Business it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended
this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough space to create this
book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book from a smart phone. The
price is not too expensive but this book has high quality.

Steve Henry:

You can find this Irrational Persistence: Seven Secrets That Turned a Bankrupt Startup Into a $231,000,000
Business by browse the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve issue if you
get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only by means of written or printed
but in addition can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking of
your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more
information about your publication. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge
are still upgrade. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.

Clark Abeyta:

As a student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or even make
summary for some book, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's heart or real their
pastime. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but nothing
reading critically. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring and also can't see colorful photos



on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we know that on this
period of time, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this Irrational Persistence: Seven Secrets That Turned a Bankrupt Startup Into a
$231,000,000 Business can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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