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Taking you by the hand and walking you through the forest of "Twin Digits", "Mates", "Doubles", "Mirrors"
and "GT9 Values", leading lottery strategist Ama Maynu (alias SBIP999) has produced a comprehensive, no
fluff, and no nonsense lottery manual for serious students of the Pick 3 Cash 4 Lottery Games. Whether you
are a newbie or seasoned player, you will learn something new to catapult your game to the next level in this
long-awaited Guide. Guaranteed! Want to know which single pairs like to turn into doubles? Or the best time
of the month to play your high payout triples and quads, or triples in the Pick 4? This Guide spills the beans
from a leader in producing calendar-based lottery predictions. At least six (6) new SBIP999 previously
unpublished lottery strategies are unveiled. In addition, you get exclusive insights into the Master Digit 9,
which will make finding your pairs and trios as easy as 1-2-3. But, perhaps best of all for Pick 4 Players
especially, Maynu lets you in on a previously well-guarded secret on how to use "resistant versus non
resistant" digits to win more in the Pick 4. This exclusive concept--discovered after years of study--is so
basic, and works so well to find your pairs in the Pick 3 and your trios in the Pick 4, that you will wonder
how you ever made a playlist without it. Tip #6 alone--which allows you to distinguish the different types of
lottery combinations that fall in your non-computerized, mechanical ball drawings--is worth the price of
admission to this Guide. This Chapter is so important to your success in the Pick 4 that SBIP999 gives you
four unique strategies to put it to use immediately. In the author's own words: "This Guide is the answer to
many of my customers who have asked me repeatedly when I planned to publish my '12 Weeks to Pick 3
Mastery' Course which I have been threatening to do for years. "But this book is better than such a course for
two major reasons: number one, you get to go through the book at your own speed. And, number 2, you will
not have to pay for it weekly or monthly, but it comes delivered with a one-off, one time price for all the
valuable lessons contained within. "I learned so much while penning these winning tips based on proven
number laws -- tips that can make a big difference in your game when you put them to good use. And, yes, I
am thrilled at the new "JMIU Lottery Strategy" that was unveiled in the Bonus Chapter of the Guide! Can't
wait to try it out in the Carolinas," Maynu said. This is the 2nd Edition--most recent--with slightly larger font
(13 pt) for ease of reading and is $5.00 cheaper than 1st edition.
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From reader reviews:

Jerry Gavin:

The knowledge that you get from 9 Simple Tips and Strategies for Winning the Pick 3 Cash 4 Lottery
Games: The Definitive Guide for Learning the Mathematics of Random is the more deep you looking the
information that hide into the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book
is hard to comprehend but 9 Simple Tips and Strategies for Winning the Pick 3 Cash 4 Lottery Games: The
Definitive Guide for Learning the Mathematics of Random giving you excitement feeling of reading. The
writer conveys their point in specific way that can be understood simply by anyone who read the idea
because the author of this book is well-known enough. This specific book also makes your vocabulary
increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We suggest you for having this specific 9 Simple Tips and Strategies for Winning the Pick 3 Cash
4 Lottery Games: The Definitive Guide for Learning the Mathematics of Random instantly.

Anne Larsen:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story or even their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they write
about the knowledge about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your kids, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors in this world always try to
improve their talent in writing, they also doing some study before they write to the book. One of them is this
9 Simple Tips and Strategies for Winning the Pick 3 Cash 4 Lottery Games: The Definitive Guide for
Learning the Mathematics of Random.

Elizabeth Parker:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get
great deal of stress from both everyday life and work. So , once we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not just a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity
do you have when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then
ever try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the book
you have read is 9 Simple Tips and Strategies for Winning the Pick 3 Cash 4 Lottery Games: The Definitive
Guide for Learning the Mathematics of Random.

Mary Patterson:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book 9 Simple Tips and Strategies for Winning the Pick 3
Cash 4 Lottery Games: The Definitive Guide for Learning the Mathematics of Random was colorful and of
course has pictures around. As we know that book 9 Simple Tips and Strategies for Winning the Pick 3 Cash



4 Lottery Games: The Definitive Guide for Learning the Mathematics of Random has many kinds or type.
Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and feel that you are
the character on there. So , not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun
and chill out. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading that.
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