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How do laws resemble rules of games, moral rules, personal rules, rules found in religious teachings, school
rules, and so on? Are laws rules at all? Are they all made by human beings? And if so how should we go
about interpreting them? How are they organized into systems, and what does it mean for these systems to
have 'constitutions'? Should everyone want to live under a system of law? Is there a special kind of 'legal
justice'? Does it consist simply in applying the law of the system? And how does it relate to the ideal of 'the
rule of law'?

These and other classic questions in the philosophy of law form the subject-matter of Law as a Leap of Faith.
In this book John Gardner collects, revisits, and supplements fifteen years of celebrated writings on general
questions about law and legal systems - writings in which he attempts, without loss of philosophical finesse
or insight, to cut through some of the technicalities with which the subject has become encrusted in the late
twentieth century. Taking his agenda broadly from H.L.A. Hart's The Concept of Law (1961), Gardner
shows how the key ideas in that work live on, and how they have been and can still be improved in modest
ways to meet important criticisms - in some cases by concession, in some cases by circumvention, and in
some cases by restatement. In the process Gardner engages with key ideas of other modern giants of the
subject including Kelsen, Holmes, Raz, and Dworkin. Most importantly he presents the main elements of his
own unique and refreshingly direct way of thinking about law, brought together in one place for the first
time.
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From reader reviews:

Todd Jacob:

Do you considered one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained within the straightway,
hold on guys this kind of aren't like that. This Law as a Leap of Faith: Essays on Law in General book is
readable by simply you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the info here are arrange for
enjoyable reading experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The
writer of Law as a Leap of Faith: Essays on Law in General content conveys the idea easily to understand by
many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it just different such as
it. So , do you still thinking Law as a Leap of Faith: Essays on Law in General is not loveable to be your top
listing reading book?

Victor Loy:

The publication with title Law as a Leap of Faith: Essays on Law in General contains a lot of information
that you can understand it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This kind of book exist new
understanding the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world now. That
is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you in new era of the
internationalization. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you
want.

Helen Williams:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Law as a Leap of Faith: Essays on Law in
General book written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book which can be understand
by anyone who all read the book. Written with good manner for you, dripping every ideas and producing
skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still skepticism Law as a Leap of Faith: Essays on Law in
General as good book not just by the cover but also from the content. This is one publication that can break
don't judge book by its protect, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on
your studying sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Debra Treat:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
native or citizen want book to know the upgrade information of year to year. As we know those guides have
many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. By book Law as a
Leap of Faith: Essays on Law in General we can take more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? For
being creative person must prefer to read a book. Just choose the best book that acceptable with your aim.
Don't be doubt to change your life by this book Law as a Leap of Faith: Essays on Law in General. You can
more attractive than now.
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