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“I think these essays are better than Andy Rooney’s,” an editor told Bob Root, after reviewing Root’s
collection of radio essays, “and I’d love to publish them once you’re as famous as Andy Rooney.” Several
other editors said much the same thing, though the comparison wasn’t always to Andy Rooney and in some
cases Root was only judged to be “as good as” some well-established personality. Though his series for the
local portion of NPR’s Morning Edition ran for eight years and was heard throughout central and northern
Michigan, Root suspected that he wasn’t going to become as famous as Andy Rooney. Once he stopped
essaying for the radio to write and edit a number of other books, the more than two-hundred-and-fifty radio
scripts were relegated to a file box that was scarcely opened twice in the ensuing twenty-five years. In that
interval Bob Root continued to teach composition and literature courses at Central Michigan University and
introduced new courses in creative nonfiction into its master’s program in composition and communication.
After taking early retirement he taught for the Lighthouse Writers Workshop in Denver and the Loft Literary
Center in Minneapolis and currently teaches nonfiction in the low-residency MFA Program in Creative
Writing at Ashland University. He presented at national, international, and regional conferences on
composition and creative nonfiction, was invited to speak at writing programs and workshops, and published
widely in literary and educational journals. He also edited historical manuscripts, served as an artist-in-
residence at three national parks, and published seventeen books. While writing his recent memoir,
Happenstance, he happened again upon his radio essays, some of which were important for the new book. He
had also been preparing his grandmother’s 1937 psychology column, How to Develop Your Personality, for
e-book and print-on-demand publication, and as he reviewed the radio essays, he realized that he didn’t have
to wait to be as famous as Andy Rooney anymore—he could bring the collection out into the world for
people who enjoyed the series to encounter again and for anyone else to discover. “This is Bob Root,
thinking out loud” was the signature close of each broadcast essay, and “Thinking Out Loud” became the
working title of the series. Limited Sight Distance: Essays for Airwaves collects fifty of the best “Thinking
Out Loud” essays, as well as three additional essays written after the series ended, including the longer title
essay. In that essay he writes, “For a long time now Limited Sight Distance has similarly seemed to me to be
a significant slogan for an essayist. . . . Don’t expect to see very far, it will warn me; don’t assume
unobstructed vision. . . . As an essayist I have a simple charge—to look carefully at whatever falls within my
field of vision and to reflect thoroughly, thoughtfully, on whatever I see.” In these essays he muses on the
old house in which he lives, the neighborhood around it, memories of growing up in Western New York, the
seasons he observes, the sensations of traveling, encounters with the cosmos, and interludes in the natural
world. In these pages readers will meet an amiable sojourner, observing what he finds around him, sharing
his reflections, thinking out loud.
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From reader reviews:

Henrietta Jimerson:

Here thing why this kind of Limited Sight Distance: Essays for Airwaves are different and dependable to be
yours. First of all looking at a book is good but it really depends in the content of the usb ports which is the
content is as tasty as food or not. Limited Sight Distance: Essays for Airwaves giving you information
deeper and in different ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no e-book that similar with
Limited Sight Distance: Essays for Airwaves. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your current
eyes about the thing that happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. It is possible
to bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your technique home by train. In case you are having
difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe the form of Limited Sight Distance: Essays for Airwaves in e-
book can be your substitute.

Thomas Major:

Now a day people who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not demand people to be aware of each information they get. How many
people to be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book.
Looking at a book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Limited Sight
Distance: Essays for Airwaves book because this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the
info in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Erick Graf:

The reason why? Because this Limited Sight Distance: Essays for Airwaves is an unordinary book that the
inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap that but latter it will zap you with the secret that inside. Reading
this book beside it was fantastic author who write the book in such awesome way makes the content on the
inside easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for
you because of not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you
a lot of rewards than the other book have got such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking
method. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I were you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Christina Bales:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to can
satisfy your short time to read it because all of this time you only find e-book that need more time to be
learn. Limited Sight Distance: Essays for Airwaves can be your answer mainly because it can be read by
anyone who have those short extra time problems.
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