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The Meaning of Life has always been the biggest, most significant question that faces humanity. There is no
other idea or concept more intriguing or thought provoking. Universal Logic utilizes philosophical,
scientific, metaphysical, paranormal, and religious ideas, combined with logical interpretations of each, to
help answer life's most compelling question: What is the true meaning of life? Bill J. Sego served in the
Army National Guard from 1990 through 1998 where he was a Hawk Missile Systems mechanic. From 1993
through 1997, Bill attended college at Ohio University and, after switching majors, later transferred to
Hocking College. Bill is an established, part-time blogger on Hubpages.com where he hopes to do his part in
making the world a better place for all of humankind. In addition to majoring in Secondary History
Education, Mr. Sego enrolled in a plethora of different philosophy courses, later developing a unique genre
that combines elements of idealism, rationalism, panpsychism, transhumanism, and futurism, all culminating
in an ontology he calls universal logic. He feels each has something to contribute to the "big picture," and his
book outlines that model in a way the general public is able to comprehend with little effort. Bill J. Sego was
born in Columbus, Ohio. He and his wife, Candy, reside in Logan where they operate a small, local business.
They are succeeded by 5 children, 2 grandchildren, 3 cats, 2 dogs, and a bunny. For additional resources
visit: www.universallogicbook.com
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From reader reviews:

Erich Arnold:

The reserve untitled Universal Logic: What Is the True Meaning of Life? is the reserve that recommended to
you to read. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you. The language that
article author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of investigation
when write the book, hence the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also could get
the e-book of Universal Logic: What Is the True Meaning of Life? from the publisher to make you far more
enjoy free time.

Christine Curnutt:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them loved ones
or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or even
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that is look different you can
read a new book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent 24 hours
a day to reading a e-book. The book Universal Logic: What Is the True Meaning of Life? it is rather good to
read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book.
Should you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore
very easily to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book features
high quality.

Leif Etter:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, short story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not trying Universal Logic: What Is
the True Meaning of Life? that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied through reading this
book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world a great deal better
then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be said constantly that reading practice only for the
geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all of you who want to
start reading through as your good habit, you could pick Universal Logic: What Is the True Meaning of Life?
become your own personal starter.

Julio Keith:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Universal Logic: What Is the True
Meaning of Life? publication written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that may be
understand by anyone who also read the book. Written inside good manner for you, leaking every ideas and
publishing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still doubt Universal Logic: What Is the True
Meaning of Life? as good book not simply by the cover but also by content. This is one guide that can break
don't judge book by its protect, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come
on your studying sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.
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