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This shocking, surprisingly entertaining romp into the intellectual nether regions of today's underthirty set
reveals the disturbing and, ultimately, incontrovertible truth: cyberculture is turning us into a society of
know-nothings. The Dumbest Generation is a dire report on the intellectual life of young adults and a timely
warning of its impact on American democracy and culture. For decades, concern has been brewing about the
dumbed-down popular culture available to young people and the impact it has on their futures. But at the
dawn of the digital age, many thought they saw an answer: the internet, email, blogs, and interactive and
hyper-realistic video games promised to yield a generation of sharper, more aware, and intellectually
sophisticated children. The terms "information superhighway" and "knowledge economy" entered the
lexicon, and we assumed that teens would use their knowledge and understanding of technology to set
themselves apart as the vanguards of this new digital era. That was the promise. But the enlightenment didn't
happen. The technology that was supposed to make young adults more aware, diversify their tastes, and
improve their verbal skills has had the opposite effect. According to recent reports from the National
Endowment for the Arts, most young people in the United States do not read literature, visit museums, or
vote. They cannot explain basic scientific methods, recount basic American history, name their local political
representatives, or locate Iraq or Israel on a map. The Dumbest Generation: How the Digital Age Stupefies
Young Americans and Jeopardizes Our Future is a startling examination of the intellectual life of young
adults and a timely warning of its impact on American culture and democracy. Over the last few decades,
how we view adolescence itself has changed, growing from a pitstop on the road to adulthood to its own
space in society, wholly separate from adult life. This change in adolescent culture has gone hand in hand wi
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From reader reviews:

Lois Yale:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yeah, you can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a
go walking, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book called [ The
Dumbest Generation: How the Digital Age Stupefies Young Americans and Jeopardizes Our Future (Or,
Don't Trust Anyone Under 30) ] By Bauerlein, Mark ( Author ) [ 2009 ) [ Paperback ]? Maybe it is to get
best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you
can cleverer than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have additional opinion?

Roger Patrick:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive now, people have
do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the item for a while is reading. Yep,
by reading a e-book your ability to survive improve then having chance to stay than other is high. In your
case who want to start reading a book, we give you this particular [ The Dumbest Generation: How the
Digital Age Stupefies Young Americans and Jeopardizes Our Future (Or, Don't Trust Anyone Under 30) ]
By Bauerlein, Mark ( Author ) [ 2009 ) [ Paperback ] book as nice and daily reading book. Why, because this
book is greater than just a book.

Elisa Dumont:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior give you lot of
advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book
this improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of guide you
read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education books but if you want really feel happy read
one together with theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The [ The Dumbest Generation: How the
Digital Age Stupefies Young Americans and Jeopardizes Our Future (Or, Don't Trust Anyone Under 30) ]
By Bauerlein, Mark ( Author ) [ 2009 ) [ Paperback ] is kind of e-book which is giving the reader erratic
experience.

Allison Lyon:

It is possible to spend your free time to see this book this book. This [ The Dumbest Generation: How the
Digital Age Stupefies Young Americans and Jeopardizes Our Future (Or, Don't Trust Anyone Under 30) ]
By Bauerlein, Mark ( Author ) [ 2009 ) [ Paperback ] is simple to create you can read it in the playground, in
the beach, train along with soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the particular printed book, you
can buy often the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart



phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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