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After her mother's death, Alyse Myers covets only one thing: a wooden box that sits in the back of a closet.
Its contents have been kept from her for her entire life. When she was thirteen years old her mother promised
she could have the box, "when I'm dead. In fact, it'll be my present to you."

Growing up in Queens in the 1960s and '70s, Alyse always yearned for more in life, while her mother settled
for an unhappy marriage, an unsatisfying job, and ultimately a joyless existence. Her father drifts in and out
of their home. There are harrowing fights, abject cruelty, and endless uncertainty. Throughout her childhood
Alyse adamantly rejects everything about her mother's lifestyle, leaving her mother to ask "Who do you
think you are?"

A personal portrait of a mother and daughter, Who Do You Think You Are? explores the profound and
poignant revelations that so often can come to light only after a parent has died. Balancing childhood
memories with adult observations, Alyse Myers creates a riveting and deeply moving narrative.
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From reader reviews:

Joshua Lippert:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold
on guys this kind of aren't like that. This Who Do You Think You Are?: A Memoir book is readable by
means of you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable
reading through experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The
writer connected with Who Do You Think You Are?: A Memoir content conveys thinking easily to
understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it just
different available as it. So , do you even now thinking Who Do You Think You Are?: A Memoir is not
loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Frances Oberlin:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book particularly book
entitled Who Do You Think You Are?: A Memoir your brain will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in every aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging each
word written in a guide then become one web form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never
get ahead of. The Who Do You Think You Are?: A Memoir giving you yet another experience more than
blown away your mind but also giving you useful information for your better life with this era. So now let us
explain to you the relaxing pattern is your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished
reading it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Cleora Yarbro:

As we know that book is important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a book we can know
everything we want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This book Who Do You Think You Are?: A Memoir was filled with regards to science.
Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has several feel
when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a
reserve. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Sandra Williams:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source which filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From
media social such as newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just in
search of the Who Do You Think You Are?: A Memoir when you required it?
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