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Metadata best practices and guidelines function as an essential mechanism for metadata planning, application
and management, and interoperability. There has been a rapidly growing body of digital repositories and
collections; accordingly, a wide range of digital projects and initiatives have adopted various metadata
standards. Because of differences in the formats and knowledge domains of the resources, it is inevitable that
these digital projects and initiatives may have different needs regarding metadata. Therefore, when a
metadata standard is adopted in various institutions and organizations, it may have to be modified to reflect
the community needs and characteristics of given resources. The flexibility and complex structure of natural
language allow for the representation of a concept in various ways. Thus, common understanding and
definitions of terms in a given metadata standard is essential for quality metadata generation, management,
interoperability and resource sharing. This opens up a pressing need for a systematic examination of
documentation practices, an area that up to now has been relatively unexplored. This book begins to fill the
research gap through an empirical assessment of metadata guidelines and best practices.

This is a book published as a special issue of the Journal of Library Metadata.
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From reader reviews:

Yael Whitehead:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive right now,
people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and
notice through surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated the item for a while is
reading. Sure, by reading a e-book your ability to survive raise then having chance to endure than other is
high. To suit your needs who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific Metadata Best
Practices and Guidelines: Current Implementation and Future Trends book as nice and daily reading
publication. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Mark Fetter:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be upgrade about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move forward.
Some of you maybe will certainly update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice in your case but
the problems coming to you actually is you don't know what one you should start with. This Metadata Best
Practices and Guidelines: Current Implementation and Future Trends is our recommendation to cause you to
keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Ralph McClure:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, small story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not trying Metadata Best Practices and
Guidelines: Current Implementation and Future Trends that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied by
means of reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the method for people to know
world a great deal better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be claimed constantly that
reading behavior only for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to possibly be success
person. So , for all you who want to start studying as your good habit, you are able to pick Metadata Best
Practices and Guidelines: Current Implementation and Future Trends become your current starter.

Ryan Fox:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got learners? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. So you know
that little person similar to reading or as studying become their hobby. You should know that reading is very
important and book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except your
current teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update about something by book. Numerous books
that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is niagra Metadata Best Practices and Guidelines:
Current Implementation and Future Trends.
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