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Torture has been a topic of national discussion ever since it was revealed that 'enhanced interrogation
techniques' had been authorized as part of the war on terror. The United States and Torture provides us with
a larger lens through which to view America's policy of torture, one that dissects America's long relationship
with interrogation and torture, which roots back to the 1950s and has been applied, mostly in secret, to
'enemies' ever since. The United States and Torture opens with a compelling preface by Sister Dianna Ortiz,
who describes the unimaginable treatment she endured in Guatemala in 1987 at the hands of the the
Guatemalan government, which was supported by the United States. Following Ortiz's preface, an
interdisciplinary panel of experts offers one of the most comprehensive examinations of torture to date,
beginning with the Cold War era and ending with today's debate over accountability for torture.
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From reader reviews:

Margaret Williams:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you can
add your knowledge by the book entitled The United States and Torture: Interrogation, Incarceration, and
Abuse. Try to make book The United States and Torture: Interrogation, Incarceration, and Abuse as your
close friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you truly feel alone and beside that course make
you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you a lot more
confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let me make new experience and
knowledge with this book.

Christopher Watson:

Inside other case, little folks like to read book The United States and Torture: Interrogation, Incarceration,
and Abuse. You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. Provided that we know about how is
important any book The United States and Torture: Interrogation, Incarceration, and Abuse. You can add
understanding and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from
book you can learn everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you will be known. About
simple issue until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or perhaps
searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel weary to go to the library.
Let's examine.

John Charles:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information currently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is from the former life are challenging be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you have it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen in you if you take The United States and Torture: Interrogation,
Incarceration, and Abuse as your daily resource information.

Stanley Rivas:

Reading a book to become new life style in this yr; every people loves to go through a book. When you learn
a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, because book
has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that you have
read. If you need to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if you act like
you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these us novel, comics, in addition to soon.
The The United States and Torture: Interrogation, Incarceration, and Abuse offer you a new experience in



reading a book.
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